
Athlete-Mobile App Features1.

All Activities

Day Week Month

Summary
Feb 17

4
hrs

8
sess

Jumping
3 hrs
Pitching
2.5 hrs
Squatting
1 hrs

Athletes

Alan Peterson 12
hrs

24
sess

Robert Parker 12
hrs

24
sess

Tyler Helmrich 12
hrs

24
sess

Richard Basdeo 12
hrs

24
sess

Andy Aukerman 12 24

9:41

OrganizationsOrganizations

Nextiles, Inc,

Nextiles Test

Nextiles QC

Switch to your Organization

You have the option to switch 
between various organizations, 
transitioning from your personal 
account to your organization. While 
on the dashboard view, simply 
swipe left to access a list of all 
organizations and proceed to 
switch accounts.

Watch Video
DISCOVERING DEVICES

9:41

Connect Device
Connect Device/Edit Device

To connect a device, click the 
module tab (second to the left) and 
scan for your device. Previously 
connected devices will be saved 
here to quickly connect

Watch Video

2 devices connected Review

Session Name

Jumping

Pitching

9:41

Session

Next

Start Session

To begin a session, go ahead by 
clicking the yellow button. You'll be 
prompted to select the activity 
you'll be engaging in during the 
session. Once you've clicked, you 
can now start your session.

Watch Video

Search

Filters

Select All 2 sessions selected

Feb 02 Thur

Download 

Options:

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Session name
Athlete name

16:56 PM

Analyzed Raw

9:41

History

Download

Download Data

Once a session is complete, view 
any previous session by clicking the 
calendar icon at the bottom right 
(second to the right) and selecting 
which session you want to review.

Watch Video

https://drive.google.com/file/d/1ScAVEikd-PYUVaR_7e81zmKmUyEz6H6K/view?pli=1
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1UazMKimkh1gsp0kY55fF0WeRmDQa5bZp/view?pli=1
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1SZMFg6lLb44-xej9aR4Rg8iCg5Fns0RM/view?pli=1
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1WO_Ssg6xI0NJZJAvgGKcSl744z5y6fGz/view?pli=1

